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ReachMoreParents is coming soon: letter for parents 

 

Coming soon! 

Get Ready to download the new Reach More Parents App 

Dear parents/carers, 

Here at [School name], we are always looking for new ways to improve communications with 
our parents and carers. In the next few weeks, we are delighted to be launching Reach More 
Parents - a new digital communications tool specifically designed for parent and Academy staff 
communications. 

Reach More Parents allows you to see live updates about your child’s education, meaning you 
will never miss a moment of your child’s learning Journey. 

Receive alerts and keep updated with School News, Trips, Learning Activities, Important 
Announcements, Key Dates and Events, Attendance Information and much more! 

We’ll soon be providing all the information you need to get started. This will include an 
enrolment message, and both priority one and two contacts with parental responsibility will be 
sent an enrolment code. 

Stay tuned for your enrolment message and further instructions — coming soon! 

As a school, we are very excited about what Reach More Parents has to offer, and we look 
forward to welcoming you on board with us on our exciting journey to successful 
communication. 

Kind regards, 

[School Signature] 

 

ReachMoreParents is coming soon: letter for staff 

Coming soon! 

Dear Staff, 

We are sure you will agree that communication isn’t always easy when working in a school. As 
you know, we are always looking for new ways to improve communication with our parents, 
without adding unnecessary pressure to you, as our staff. With this is mind, within the next few 
weeks, we will be launching Reach More Parents as our main source of communication in 
school, with the aim to make all of our communications quicker and easier, whilst keeping 
everything all in one place. 

Reach More Parents is a digital communications tool which allows us to share a wealth of 
important information in a timely manner to our parents. It provides a great platform for us to 
notify them about a variety of things, including key dates in the term, upcoming trips, activities 



   
 

 

their child has taken part in, as well as many other things. Reach More Parents will also allow 
you to message parents directly. 

We will be starting the enrolment process over the next few weeks which will include training to 
ensure we are getting the best out of the system. Following this, we will send out further 
instructions to staff and parents on how to enrol on the Reach More Parents app/access the 
web platform and how to navigate the different areas that are included in the software. 

We are very excited about what Reach More Parents has to offer to enhance communication in 
our school, and we look forward to having you all on board with us. 

Kind regards, 

[HEADTEACHER SIGNATURE] 

 

ReachMoreParents New starter letter 

Dear [Parent/Carer Name] 

Here at [School name], we use ReachMoreParents a digital communications tool specifically 
designed for parent and Academy staff communications. 

ReachMoreParents allows you to see live updates about your child’s education meaning you will 
never miss a moment of your child’s learning Journey. 

Receive alerts and keep updated with School News, Trips, Learning Activities, Important 
Announcements, Key Dates and Events, Attendance Information and much more! 

How to log in to ReachMoreParents: 

· By downloading the app onto your smart phone or tablet. You can download 
ReachMoreParents from the App Store or Google Play. 

· By logging in via the Reach More Parents website/portal at: https://app.weduc.co.uk/ 

You will be receiving an enrolment message, and both priority one and two contacts with 
parental responsibility will be provided with an enrolment code, plus instructions on how to 
download the app. 

Look out for your Enrolment message and instructions coming soon! 

Thanks 

[School Signature] 

https://app.weduc.co.uk/

